IRRIGATION AT BASEBALL/SOFTBALL FIELDS AT RANDOLPH HS/MS BID TABULAT									ABULATION V	TON WORKSHEET 1
Contractor Name		Andy-Matt, Inc	Wicklow & Laurano	National Lawn Sprinklers	Let It Grow, Inc	BZ Irrigation	Garden Irrigation	\$0 . 00	0	<u>(</u>
	Trade Address Line #1 Address Line #2 Telephone e-mail	General Contractor PO Box 461 Wharton, NJ 973-584-6869 andymattinc@yahoo,com	General Contractor 362 Route 206 Flanders, NJ 973-584-3770 edwardclark.la@verizon.net	General Contractor 645 N Broadway White Plains, NY 914-946-6666 gordon@natlawn.com	General Contractor 52 Ackerson Street River Edge, NJ 201-478-6266 doreilly@letitgrow.com	General Contractor PO Box 596 Clifton NJ 07012 973-777-7188 lisakulesa@gmail.com	General Contractor 316 Tennent Morganville, NJ 732-972-9100 grogers@wetlawn.com	General Contractor \$0.00 \$0.00 - 000-00-0000	General Contractor \$0.00 \$0.00 - 000-00-0000	SOLUTIONS ARCHITECTURE FRANK A. MESSINEO*AIA
	BASE BID CONTRACT	\$ 136,702.00		\$ 69,500.00	\$ 127,900.00		\$ 88,000.00			PROJECT:
	TOTAL SELECTED BASE BID	\$ 136,702.00	<u> </u>	\$ 69,500.00	1	\$ -	\$ 88,000.00	\$ -	\$ -	Irrigation at Baseball/
	10111252220125 27152 2715	1,50,702,100	Ψ	+ 03,500.00	7 127,300.00		7 30,000,00	7	Ψ	Softball Fields at
F	REQUIRED DOCUMENTS:	SUBMITTED DOCUMENTS								
ALLOWANCE No.1	-	not reviewed	no bid	х	not reviewed	no bid	х			Randolph HS/MS PROJECT No:
FULLY EXECUTED FORM OF F	LLY EXECUTED FORM OF PROPOSAL		no bid	х	not reviewed	no bid	х			12.166B
KNOWLEDGEMENT OF ADDENDA		not reviewed	no bid	n/a	not reviewed	no bid	n/a			
UNIT PRICES FILLED IN:	IT PRICES FILLED IN:		no bid	n/a	not reviewed	no bid	n/a			
BID BOND OR CERT. OR CASE	BOND OR CERT. OR CASHIER'S CHECK (10% OF BID TOTAL)		no bid	х	not reviewed	no bid	х			PROJECT BUDGET
CERTIFICATE OF SURETY CEF	TIFICATE OF SURETY CERTIFICATE		no bid	х	not reviewed	no bid	х			\$ 60,000
NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT	N-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT (NOTARIZED)		no bid	х	not reviewed	no bid	х			
FIRMATIVE ACTION AFFIDAVIT		not reviewed	no bid	х	not reviewed	no bid	х			BIDS DUE:
STOCKHOLDER / PARTNERSH	OCKHOLDER / PARTNERSHIP DISCLOSURE STATEMENT		no bid	х	not reviewed	no bid	х			8/20/2013
FIDAVIT RE LIST OF DEBARRED, SUSPENDED, DISQ. BIDDERS		not reviewed	no bid	х	not reviewed	no bid	х			10:00am
RTIFICATE OF NO MATERIAL CHANGE OF CIRCUMSTANCES		not reviewed	no bid	х	not reviewed	no bid	х			
CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE	ERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE STATEMENT		no bid	х	not reviewed	no bid	х			CONTACT: SOLUTIONS ARCHITECTURE
NJ DEPT OF TREASURY NOTI	J DEPT OF TREASURY NOTICE OF CLASSIFICATION		no bid	х	not reviewed	no bid	х			
NJ DEPT OF TREASURY UNCO	DEPT OF TREASURY UNCOMPLETED CONTRACTS CERT.		no bid	х	not reviewed	no bid	х			
NJ DEPT OF PUBLIC WORKS	CONTRACTOR REGIST CERT.	not reviewed	no bid	х	not reviewed	no bid	х			81 Clay Street 2nd Floor, Suite 2
NJ DEPT OF TREASURY - BUS	INESS REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE	not reviewed	no bid	х	not reviewed	no bid	х			Newark, NJ 07104
NJ DEPT OF TREASURY-CERT	IFICATE OF AUTHORITY	not reviewed	no bid	х	not reviewed	no bid	х			o 973-484-4800
OLITICAL CONTRIBUTION DISCLOSURE FORM C.271		not reviewed	no bid	not provided	not reviewed	no bid	х			f 201.706.7777 e bidding@solutions-
ST OF RELATED COMPLETED PROJECTS WITH REFERENCES		not reviewed	no bid	х	not reviewed	no bid	х			arch.com
RRENT TRADE LICENCES		not reviewed	no bid	х	not reviewed	no bid	х			www.soinfinis-qu.cu.com
ADDITIONAL NOTES:										

FFT Exhibit 8, 08-20-13 BIDDERS LIST_BID TAB - 2013 Page 1 of 1