UV REPLACEMENTS

AT RANDOLPH SCHOOLS

BID TABULATION WORKSHEET 1

: Cenerll(omnuul ' Ceneral Contractor Ceneral Contractor Leneral Contractor General Contractor Clt:n«dlr( === -
Metuchen, NJ Mountan Lakes hJ Mew Brunswick NJ OceanNJ DOeeanNJ Hami N) Kenilworth NJ
= “Telephone S5 T D 3o S Y5 755 O . e B G S ey s | e e S0 TIONS
Pax — i I N o | = P . e e e |~ U] reanka upiEnga-aa
~ Al ik EnOT e
R | | IWGS e s Lo et |
. o CONTRACT A-CENTER GROVE | ¢ 960,000.00 | $ 48,000.00 | $ 1,519,000.00 | $ L $ %144,000.00 | $  1,278,000.00 | § 1,393,000.00 NO BID $ 1,469,000.00 { $ (184,000.00)| $  (136,000.00) uvreracenenTs ar
CONTRACT B-FERNBROOK | ¢ 780,000.00 | ¢  39,000.00 | § 1,085,000.00 | § $ 1,091,000.00 | §  889,325.00 | $ 997,00000| NOBID | $ 1,069,000.00 | §  (109,325.00)| §  (70,325.00) Munes scuoots
CONTRACT C-IRONIA | 5 1,050,000.00 | $ 52,500.00 | $ 1,459,000.00 | $ $ 1,397,000.00 | § 1,278,000.00 | $ 1,447,000.00 NO BID $ 1,489,000.00 | $ (228,000.00)] $  (175,500.00)]
CONTRACT D- SHONGUM | 4  1,080,000.00 | $ 54,000.00 | $ 1,320,000.00 | $ $ 1,399,000.00 | §  1,175,500.00 | $ 1,293,000.00 NO BID $ 1,369,000.00 | (95,500.00)| $ (41,500.00) |
CONTRACT E- COMBINED OVERALL | $  3,870,000.00 | 5  193,500.00 | § 5,374,000.00 | $ $ 4,993,000.00 | $ 4,616,825.00 | $ 5,100,000.00 NO BID $ 5,369,000.00 | $ (746.825}.231 $ .,(5.5.3._'?.1.5_:9_‘.’.).,; uaogj
ALTERNATE M-+ - CONTROLS | $ - $ 140,000.00 | § $  199,000.00 | § 275,000.00 { $ 175,000.00 NO BID $ 198,000.00 | $ - $ -]
| ALTERNATE M-2 - UV MANUF OPTION | § - $ 500,000.00 | $ $ - QUALIFIED $  100,000.00 NO BID $ 80,000.00 | $ $ 1
ALTERNATE GC-1 - NEW LOW SHELVING | & . $ 15500000 | § $  42,675.00 QUALIFIED $  350,000.00 NO BID $  66,000.00 | s ]
| TOTAL CONTRACT WITH ALL ALTERNATES | ¢  3,870,000.00 4 6,169,000,00 | § $ 5,234,675.00 1 5  4,891,825.00 | $ §,725,000.00 NO BID $ 5,713,000.00 | $ (746,825.00)| (ss;,azs.oo)f 1
NO BID |
TOTAL ALL (4) SCHOOLS INDIVIDUALLYY § - $ 5,383,000.00 | § $ 5,031,000.00 § $ 4,620,825.00 | § 5,130,000.00 NO BID $ 5,396,000.00 | § - $ -
“mm Mot yARIES PER CONTRACT 2 g & .
FULLY ERECUTED FORM OF MOPOSAL (WOTARRED) U U = g L) ° o 9 o s By 3/460,000.00
-5 8D TOTAL a a a o -] ] ] ) = 5 5 3450 |
[eLRTIICATE OF SURETY CERTICATE L] L] U O O O a o a o r’
[rsrromvr s ist or orsanio, suseeroo, osquavr e sopers “ hd " L L L L L L] L | e |
[ COULSION ASTIOAT (NOTARZLD) L] w a ] (] ] L] ] a C] a 15 May 1
L mmarive action As ot (] C] ] (] ] ] (] ] ] ] L] Ip
{STOCKMOLDER 1 PAKTHE RSP OSCLOTIRE STATEMINT L] L] L " = o L] L] L] L =
KEATIFICATE OF LNGURANCE STATLMENT L) = - v L) LJ L) ! JF = = ol
[ DT 3¢ TREASUAY WOTICE DF CLATHICATION = = L] o e o L] O r L] e I
e ] a L] ] ] L] ] -] Fiu ] =
R4 DLFT 0 PLIBLIC WORKS - CONTRACTOR REGISTRATION EEATIFEATE o L o o e B I o a L] | -
M1 OEPT OF TREASURY  USINESS RECSTRATION CERTIFCATL L] L) L i . 8 i s B - _‘ a.‘l‘::
fmuﬂM'-mv-unnlu‘!wwmmmﬁlmmm LT [ a a a o o a a o L) e | Nomart, 1407104 |
] ] (] ] 8 (] ] ] o o i)
A KAWLEDCEMINT F ADOLNOA L] o a a ] [-] a o -] a a o prrpttpuny
INCT PRICES PR L0 N g [ ] ] ] ] L] [] = (] L]
| AL sITES,

FFT Exhibit 1, 06/12/12



Girls Locker Room Renovations at Randolph HS and MS

BID TABULATION WORKSHEET 1

S SN |

- s d Erﬂie General Contractor Ceneral Contractor General Contractor . ge__l_'_tgfa_l Contractor |  General Contgcgu |
ISl Address Line #1 = S e f e
Address Line #2 New Brunswick NJ Pittstown NJ Millburn NJ Edison, NJ Rockaway NJ SOLUTION S |
I Telephone (732) 247-9700 (908) 735-6636 (973) 376-6116 732:393-9610 (973) 983-7979 |
| Faxi] 0 00 o0 0 | Sy = = = S : i e ) FRANK A. MESSINEC "AlA |
' ACieri@tekiondevelopme| cmacluke@embargmail.g :
e-mail shanna@grafas.nel ¥p1582@gmal.com lams@optoniine nat |
i nleom om |
| |
| BASE BID CONTRACT 'A"; i $ 436,400.00 | $ 324,600.00 [Girls Locker Room Renovations
L .
BASE BID CONTRACT 'B": 1 $ 237,600.00 | $ 248,600.00 |atRandolph HS and MS
r — —
| BASE BID CONTRACT 'C": no bid | $ 674,000.00 | $ 573,200.00 ]
1 oy
| Alternate No. GC-1 o bid T $ 10,625.00 | ¢ 12,000.00
[ Alternate No. GC-2A yid $ 5,600.00 | $ 6,000.00 u.mT'i
Alternate No. GC-2B| b $ 4,300.00 | $ 5,500.00
| Alternate No. GC-3A| $ 1,100.00 | § 1,000.00
_— R |
| Alternate No. GC-3B| c i $ 1,100.00 | $ 1,000.00
| Alternate No. GC-4 $ 4,800.00 | $ 15,000.00 |
g I
| TOTAL SELECTED CONTRACT:| $ - - - $ 701,525.00 | $ 613,700.00
I ——
]
|ALLOWANCE Noy  'clude the sum of $10,000 dollars for discretionary use by #] =] a a =] o R i
| 4 Owner ($6K + $4K) - B =g = ]
|FULLY EXECUTED FORM OF PROPOSAL (NOTARIZED) o =] o o a “$ - 400,000.00 =
| ; o a a o =] o
[810 BOND OR CERTIFIELD CHECK or CASHIER'S CHECK (10% OF BID TOTAL) ($259,000 +$150,000) |
|CERTIFICATE OF SURETY CERTIFICATE = = = o = o |
|CERTIFICATE OF NO MATERIAL CHANGE OF GIRCIMSTANCE B 2 o o o G 05 DUE: o |
| =~
a =] a 5] ] o 1
!AFHDAVH’RE LIST OF DEBARRED, SUSPENDED, DISQUALIFIED BIDDERS zoopm |
|NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT (NOTARIZED} o o C] o o a 6-Jun-12 !
— — —
AFFIRMATIVE ACTION AFFIDAVIT o = o = el =]
(are ) ) ) ‘
|STOCKHOLOER / PARTNERSHIP DISCLOSURE STATEMENT a Kl o o o o ‘
I -— - - -
|BIDDER CERTIFICATION REGARDING QUALIFICATIONS AND CREDENTIALS o o o Lo} a = |
|CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE STATEMENT g o o B a o T
NJ DEPT OF TREASURY NOTICE OF CLASSIFICATION = o o o o o ) 1
tu DEPT OF TREASURY LINCOMPLETED CONTRACTS CERTIFICATION 2] = o o o CHE . |
1, CONTACT:
NS DEPT OF PUBLIC WORKS - CONTRACTOR REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE L) o =} o el o
L SOLUTIONS ARCHITECTURE
|NJ DEPT OF TREASURY - BUSINESS REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE o o o C] o o 81 Clay Sveet
2nd Floor. Sute 2
NJ DEPT OF TREASURY - CERTIFICATE OF AUTHORITY TO PERFORM WORK N NJ = & = =) o 8 Bawyark. 1) 07104
2017087778
| ACKNOWLEDGEMENT OF ADDENDA 1 g g = g = T 2017067777 |
- heom |
UNIT PRICES FILLED IN: 17 g2 ) 2 = o 2 I e T [
| ADDITIONAL NOTES: FFT Exh.2. 06/12/12
;hbawn Page oy i 6!1;.116“



Trade

Address Line #2

| Fields and Grandstand Renovations at Randolph High School

General Contractor General Contractor

Address Line #1 |
Montville, NJ 07045

Ocean Grove NJ

BID TABULATION WORKSHEET 1

~ General Contractor

~ Hackensack NJ

Ceneral Contractor

Hackensack NJ

SOLUTIONS

Telephone| (732) 677-0484 (_mn) 439-1000 (201) 641-4288 I
Pax FRANK A. MESSINEO " AIA |
502 dakota imatin |
: molds@astroturf.com excavaling@yahoo.com acting com |
e-mail m of o e |
BASE BID CONTRACT VALUE;]| s 2,063,557.00 $ - $ - 1,923,988.00 Flelds and Grandstand Renovations |
1
Bauer Field:] 1,093,557.00 | § - $ - 1,153,688.00 [at Randolph High Schaol '
— _—
DaSilva: Field:| $ $ - $ - 770,300.00 |
1
Alternate No. 1| $ $ - $ - 478,056.00 '
Alternate No. 2| $ $ - $ - 177,480.00 12.104|
Alternate No. 3| $ $ : $ o 86,880.00 |
Field Total| $ $ g $ - - |
TOTAL SELECTED CONTRACT:| % 2,747,212.00 | $ - [ - 2,666,404.00 ]
a D a (] !
ALLOWANCE No.t Include the sum of $20,000 dollars for discretionary use
by Owner R ]
IFULLY EXECUTED FORM OF PROPOSAL (NOTARIZED) ~ 8 s = 8 $2.8M ]
BID BOND OR CERTIFIELD CHECK or CASHIER'S CHECK (10% OF BID TOTAL) e 2 et = =
CERTIFICATE OF SURETY CERTIFICATE o a a. =] a |
CERTIFICATE OF NO MATERIAL CHANGE OF CIRCUMSTANCE 0. 2 a = ¥ :
IAFFIDAVIT RE LIST OF DEBARRED, SUSPENDED, DISQUALIFIED BIDDERS o = D = 8 1:00pm
NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT (NOTARIZED) a 2 a L 2 6-Jun-12
- — —— -
{AFFIRMATIVE ACTION AFFIDAVIT g L 9 S a
L - = = —
{STOCKHOLDER  PARTNERSHIP DISCLOSURE STATEMENT e = o = 2
} —_ _—
Eczmmcme OF INSURANCE STATEMENT a e a d 2
i;u DEPT OF TREASURY NOTICE OF CLASSIFICATION a = Q = L
[NJ DEPT OF TREASURY LINCOMPLETED CONTRACTS CERTIFICATION a 2 a = = TG
— o] ) o o 3 SOLUTIONS ARCHITECTURE
N DEPT OF PUBLIC WORKS - CONTRACTOR REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE 81 Clay Street
; T = ] z = 2nd Floor, Sulte 2
|NJ DEPT OF TREASURY - BUSINESS REGISTRATION CERTIFICATE Newark, NJ 07104
:NJ DEPT OF TREASURY - CERTIFICATE OF AUTHORITY TO PERFORM WORK IN NJ Q 2 =l = - g g; ;g % I
a a [s] [n] -] o biddng@soltions-arch.com |
|ACKNOWLEDGEMENT OF ADDENDA 1 Ak solutions-arch B8
o 5] a @

]
|UNIT PRICES FILLED IN: 18

|ADDITIONAL NOTES:

KI0000a15

FFT Exh.3, 06/12/12-
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WINDOW REPLACEMENTS AT RANDOLPH SCHOOLS BID TABULATION WORKSHEET 1

Trade| Ceneral (amrxlm_ 4 Ceneral Contractor | Ceneral (._mxrx(or 1 Ge_nual Contractor Generat Contractor cev_me_r_a_l Comriuor General Contractar _ceqcral Lantractor Ceneral Cantractor General Contractor | |
Address Line #1 - X |
Add:unT:t:_;h::__. Rut_h_c_rf_o_vd_w_}_ = _i'%:_i;_i:;\!_};;l'___ __ _:O_A_m___ e 40.00 BT ] O $0.00 ___ L so.oo___ ., 4 :no_ = 3 ____ _ k¥ -__ s_otoo___ gy ‘I SOLUTIONS
L — - = === = == i PRANK A, MESSINPO"AIA
RSl it e e i ] P R i O B e e e e e
CONTRACT A- CENTER GROVE| $  259,000.00 | $  354,000.00 | §  295,000.00 $ - $ - $ - $ 0 $ - $ - $ - :mmnzmm |
CONTRACT B - FERNBROOK! $ 87,000.00 | $ 105,950.00 | $  108,000.00 | $ - $ - $ - 4 & $ o $ - $ - [MuLTIME SCHOOLS
CONTRACT C- IRONIA} $ 217,500.00 | $ 257,000.00 | $  247,000.00 | § - $ . $ - $ - $ - $ - $ | |
CONTRACT D- SHONGUM| 8  461,900.00 | $ 531,300.00 | $  510,000.00 | § - $ - $ 0 $ - $ - $ - $ - |
CONTRACT E - COMBINED OVERALL| § 1,025,400.00 | $ 1,225,650.00 | $ 1,057,000.00 | $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - o)
ALTERNATE C-1| $ 3,200.00 | $ 5,315.00 | $ 3,000.00 |} § g $ o $ 0 $ g $ g $ g $ -
ALTERNATE C-2f § 50,100.00 | $ 15,900.00 | $ 45,000.00 | § g $ o $ g $ g $ g $ g $ g
ALTERNATE C-3| $ 14,100.00 | § 10,070.00 | $ 12,000.00 | § g $ o $ g $ g $ g $ g $ -
ALTERNATE F-1| ¢ 1,300.00 | § 1,905.00 | 1,000.00 | § - $ - 4 o $ 5 $ - $ - $ | |
ALTERNATE F-2| § 60,800.00 | $ 52,800.00 | $ 50,000.00 | § - $ - $ o $ - $ - $ - $ -
ALTERNATE R| $ 3,500.00 | $ 4,950.00 | $ 3,000.00 | § -1 - I - s - s BRI BRI -
ALTERNATE S-1| $ 5,700.00 | $ 9,590.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ - $ - $ g $ - $ - 4 - $ - '
ALTERNATE GC+| ¢ 43,600.00 | $ 37,500.00 | $ 72,000.00 | § - $ o $ g $ o $ o $ o $ g
$ - $ - $ g $ - $ - $ - $ -
TOTAL CONTRACT:} § 1,207,700.00 | $ 1,363,680.00 | $ 1,248,000.00 | § - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - |
TOTAL SELECTED CONTRACT:| $ 1,146,900.00 $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ - $ -
ALLOWANCENG.1, 2, | 2oec e CONTRACT « ] a ] © ] C) C] 1
:::—smcmmrem OF PAOPOSAL (NOTARIZED) L) a L] a o a o o L] a s l‘,‘xén,noo.al:'
imunoncnnmwmt«-W:nunm(wxowomm) Ll L] L] L] o L] a L] C] a
CIATIFCATE OF SURETY CRRTIFICATE L] L] L) [ L) o Q Q o o
[ p—— s ¥ L L} L) B L} L] H 3} L] 3P
INON COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT (WOTARIZED) L] L] = L] a L] L] ° a [l 7Junia
_"mw'mm,. AFFDAMT L] [] " a a a ] ] a a
. [-] - a o a a a -] -] |
(CEATIICATE OF INSURANCE STATEMENT U 9 L v L L L LS L L} ‘Y
2 DEST OF TREASURY NOTKCE OF CLASSIFKATION L 3 L] O L] 8 CJ G = =
N3 DEPTOF TREASURY LINCOMPLETED CONTRACTS CERTIFATION . 2 - © L g] g _ 2 © = 1
E— [ a ] L] [] ] [] L] [ [] |
N3 DEPTOF TREASURY - BUSINESS RECISTRATION CERTIFICATE o = » L o L Lt @ = a | T
M) DEFT OF TREASURY - CERTWICATED AUTHORITY TO PERFOIM WORK X M) a = a L] a o o L] 1 il sy
AL KNOWLEDG EMENT OF ADDINDA L 2 L = L) Gl G C) B O — L ;:g:z
JNIT PRICES SRLLED N [] a [] o a a a [] L] a a3 arch.
ADCTTONAL NOTES.

FFT Exh.4, 06/12/12



NCLB Budget Summary

StaTe oF NEW JERsSEY

DEPARTMENT OF EDUCATION

EWEG

Page 1 of 1

Electronic Web-Enabled Grant System

Applicant: 27 4330 RANDOLPH TOWNSHIP Morris Application Sections
pp * County NCLB Consolidated v
Applicationt, ;1 2012 NCLB Consofidated - 00 Project Period: 9/1/2011 - Printer-Friendly
Cycie: Amendment 1 8/31/2012 Click to Return to Application Select

Click to Return to Menu List / Sign Out
Budget Summary Instructions
Function / | Title I Part | Title I Part | TitleI SIA | Title II Title IT 2 Title 111 '
Object A D Part A Part A Part D bl 008 Immigrant TigeV1
100 Instruction
100-100 $64,386] $36,600 $5,290} $620)
100-300
100-500
100-600 $10,575) $2,721 $6,938!
100-800
200 Support Services
200-100
200-200 $8,091 $2,800 $405 $47,
200-300 $6,009 $41,520]
(200-400
Foo-soo $991 $1,881
200-600 $14,312 $1,638
1200-800
200-860
400 Fac. Acq. and Construction Ser.
400-720
400-731
400-732
520 Schoolwide
520-930 f | | i | { {
PGM ADM Program Administration
PGM ADM $4,652
e $93,713 $0 $0|  $98,944 s $16,15 $667 $0
http://njdoe.ewegp.mtwgms.org/NJDOEGmsWeb/Budget/NCLBGrantSummaryv02.aspx 6/7/2012
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